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Urban life in the twenty-first century is marked by nu-
merous stresses and shocks, resulting from rapid urban-
isation, frequent migration and crowding, massive
unemployment, climate change, physical disasters, and
disease outbreaks, among other challenges. This reality –
according to the ‘100 Resilient Cities’ initiative of the
Rockefeller Foundation – is why the concept of resilience
is critical to a sustainable future: cities must learn to
“survive and thrive, regardless of the challenge” [1]. In cit-
ies in the global South that face a heavy HIV burden, this
health crisis is often inseparable from a wider set of inter-
linked social challenges, ranging from acute economic in-
equality to chronic political mismanagement and failed
states. What ‘
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populations? What public health lessons may be ex-
tracted from the data? Collectively, the findings consti-
tute a valuable resource to inform the design and
implementation of cutting-edge, comprehensive HIV
and SRH services in inner-city settings. The articles also
provide baseline and actionable information for the
broader UNAIDS ‘Fast-Track Cities’ initiative’ to end
AIDS in cities around the globe [12]. Although Hillbrow
is in many senses unique, with a social history intimately
linked to Apartheid and its demise, this setting presents
a microcosm of issues that are common to other low-
income, inner-city areas in southern Africa and beyond.
We believe this Supplement will have significance be-
yond Hillbrow, and indeed, South Africa, as it crystal-
lises many of the public health challenges generic to
disadvantaged inner-city neighbourhoods across the
globe.

The collection of nine research articles is prefaced by
a fascinating social history of Hillbrow assembled by
Jonathan Stadler and Charles Dugmore that reveals “a
picture of enduring continuities across its 120-odd years
of existence”. Today, Hillbrow is largely defined by its
transient populations and high proportion of foreign na-
tionals who are new to the city, but historically it has
been a space of social change. Its apartment blocks were
the site of early racial integration before Apartheid’s seg-
regation laws were relaxed, and the neighbourhood be-



adolescents attending South African public health facil-
ities [16]. Clearly, there are intersecting axes of margin-
alisation and vulnerability that shape access to care, and
further research is needed to document the long-term
impact of the anti-migrant sentiment that periodically
racks South African cities.

These multiple levels of vulnerability may then be per-
petuated into the next generation. Children and adoles-
cents in this setting are affected by a range of social ills:
alcohol abuse, violence and negative gender norms are
particularly pervasive [17, 18] – highlighting how the so-
cial determinants of health play an important role, espe-
cially in the HIV epidemic. This framework is useful for
focusing attention on how factors such as poor housing
quality, high population density, limited access to clean
water and sanitation, and the presence of drugs and
gangs in the social environment play a critical role in
shaping health outcomes [19]. And while these factors





fill evidence gaps around the feasibility of recruiting and
retaining heterosexual men in an HIV vaccine trial. In a
novel trial design, a Hepatitis B Virus vaccine was given
as a surrogate for an HIV vaccine (the control group re-
ceived the vaccine after study completion). The re-
searchers found that against all expectations – given
Hillbrow’s reputation as a space where residents are
highly transient, but also because of men’s historically
low rates of accessing healthcare in the region as a
whole – retention of men in the trial was higher than in
most similar studies. And men’s motives for enrolling
were also somewhat unexpected, with many citing an al-
truistic desire to help find an efficacious HIV vaccine,
along with attributes of the clinical environment: cleanli-
ness, the welcoming attitudes of clinic staff, and being
treated by a male health worker. Seemingly obvious and
even superficial adjustments to healthcare services, like
making services for men more male-centred and staffed
by men, can really make a difference to attracting men
to arenas where they are traditionally under-represented:
HIV trials, but also routine SRH services.

In closing, despite the diversity of focus among arti-
cles in this Supplement, some common lessons emerge
about managing health in the inner-city. We should
not underestimate the impact of migration on the
health system, and how migrants new to the city –
even those within their own country – experience ex-
clusion. In this region, rapid urbanisation brings both
positive opportunity, but also threats to public systems
that were not designed to deal with high volumes of
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